

Sale Date	Case Number		Lorain County Sheriff's Office		Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
01/13/16	09TX006011	105	LAKE AVENUE AND VACANT LOT	ELYRIA		No Bid	06-26-094-104-001 06-26-094-104-002 06-26-094-104-013
01/13/16	10TX006277	273	ROXBORO ROAD AND VACANT LOT	VERMILION		Cancelled	01-00-002-111-014 01-00-002-111-015
01/13/16	10TX006364	7450	TERMINAL DRIVE	LORAIN		No Bid	01-00-010-000-006
01/13/16	12CV177298	1623	WEST 22ND STREET	LORAIN	\$33,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-025-124-002
01/13/16	13CV180110	4869	JOSEPH COURT	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-017-107-003
01/13/16	14CV183928	6065	WALLACE BLVD	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	07-00-017-126-020
01/13/16	14CV184173	412	BOND ST	ELYRIA	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	06-24-050-101-002
01/13/16	14CV184273	130	WEST MAIN STREET	SOUTH AMHERST	\$75,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-010-101-017
01/13/16	14CV184296	285	WEST LORAIN STREET	OBERLIN	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	09-00-085-101-010
01/13/16	14CV184523	410	NORTH CENTER ST	LAGRANGE	\$54,000.00	Cancelled	15-00-046-101-013
01/13/16	14CV184640	1043	MAIN ST	GRAFTON	\$57,000.00	\$38,100.00	16-00-001-112-025
01/13/16	14CV185143	216	MOORE ROAD #4R	AVON LAKE	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	04-00-006-705-009
01/13/16	14CV185196	539	WASHINGTON AVE	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	02-01-005-109-004
01/13/16	15CV185308	48546	RUSSIA ROAD	AMHERST	\$75,000.00	\$50,100.00	08-00-089-000-021
01/13/16	15CV185376	1222	PENNSYLVANIA AVE	LORAIN	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	03-00-056-104-027
01/13/16	15CV185410	888	LIVERMORE LANE	ELYRIA	\$66,000.00	Cancelled	06-25-027-101-027
01/13/16	15CV185849	437	LOUISIANA AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	06-24-028-111-026 06-24-028-111-007
01/13/16	15CV185888	480	NORTH MAIN STREET	AMHERST	\$81,000.00	\$54,000.00	05-00-018-104-021
01/13/16	15CV185921	248	SPRINGBROOK CIRCLE	ELYRIA	\$150,000.00	Cancelled	06-24-015-000-073
01/13/16	15CV185942	315	DELAWARE AVENUE	LORAIN	\$27,000.00	No Bid	02-01-003-105-005
01/13/16	15CV185993	2421	EAST 32ND STREET	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	03-00-082-108-018
01/13/16	15CV186585	5370	CORNELL AVENUE	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$90,000.00	\$65,000.00	07-00-018-105-157 07-00-018-105-071
01/13/16	15CV186607	151	HAMILTON ST	ELYRIA	\$72,000.00	\$78,000.00	06-25-036-107-002
01/13/16	15CV186721	3619	TOLEDO AVE	LORAIN	\$9,000.00	\$6,000.00	03-00-103-113-005
01/13/16	15CV186787	37065	CHESTNUT RIDGE ROAD	ELYRIA	\$252,000.00	\$200,000.00	11-00-071-000-053
01/13/16	15CV186835	1250	BEVERLY DR	AMHERST	\$114,000.00	\$76,100.00	02-02-001-104-055 02-02-001-104-084 02-02-001-104-085
01/13/16	15CV186919	1214	PENNSYLVANIA AVE	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	03-00-056-104-033
01/13/16	15CV186942	122	SHAKESPEARE LANE	AVON	\$90,000.00	\$86,500.00	04-00-022-701-046
01/13/16	15TX006522	23	MONROE COURT	OBERLIN		\$25,000.00	09-00-095-103-060
01/27/16	14CV183463	133	ASHLAND AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$171,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-005-101-165
01/27/16	14CV184056	773	OAKWOOD AVE	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$30,000.00	\$30,000.00	03-00-038-118-022 03-00-038-118-021
01/27/16	14CV184135	7721	WEST RIDGE RD	ELYRIA	\$249,000.00	\$225,000.00	06-24-018-000-029
01/27/16	14CV184907	209	PLEASANT STREET	LAGRANGE	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	15-00-056-101-025
01/27/16	14CV185141	809	ARLINGTON COURT	ELYRIA	\$81,000.00	\$89,600.00	06-25-028-104-010
01/27/16	14CV185232	224	JONES RD	WELLINGTON	\$117,000.00	\$78,000.00	18-00-026-101-055
01/27/16	15CV185451	145	HARVARD AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$57,000.00	\$65,000.00	06-25-005-103-012
01/27/16	15CV185583	6690	RIDGEVIEW BOULEVARD	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$60,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-021-114-014

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office			Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
01/27/16	15CV185738	2224	EAST 30TH STREET	LORAIN	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	03-00-094-110-013
01/27/16	15CV185798	507	BOND STREET	ELYRIA	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	06-24-070-105-017
01/27/16	15CV185841	154	FAIRFIELD DRIVE	ELYRIA	\$138,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-089-000-018
01/27/16	15CV185988	35241	JASON DR	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$120,000.00	\$105,000.00	07-00-019-000-278
01/27/16	15CV186099	2131	E 40TH ST	LORAIN	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	03-00-099-107-023
01/27/16	15CV186130	2419	HOMEWOOD DRIVE	LORAIN	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	03-00-080-105-034
01/27/16	15CV186141	3123	LEXINGTON AVENUE	LORAIN	\$15,000.00	No Bid	02-01-003-212-004
01/27/16	15CV186192	35077	ELM ROAD	GRAFTON	\$42,000.00	\$68,000.00	11-00-036-119-010
01/27/16	15CV186208	1750	EAST 33RD STREET	LORAIN	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	03-00-096-113-013
01/27/16	15CV186614	1609	MAINE AVENUE	LORAIN	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	03-00-053-105-004
01/27/16	15CV186619	103	MOOREWOOD AVE	AVON LAKE	\$117,000.00	\$78,000.00	04-00-007-108-002
01/27/16	15CV186688	1064	WEST 24TH ST	LORAIN	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	02-01-006-157-016
01/27/16	15CV186736	260	LAKE AVE	ELYRIA	\$18,000.00	\$12,000.00	06-24-124-000-013 06-24-124-000-004
01/27/16	15CV186786	4903	ELYRIA AVENUE	LORAIN	\$42,000.00	No Bid	03-00-112-103-003
01/27/16	15CV186834	302	SOUTHWOOD DR	ELYRIA	\$69,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-004-127-003
01/27/16	15CV186915	982	CHESTNUT STREET	GRAFTON	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	16-00-001-107-028
01/27/16	15CV186929	164	BROOKVALLEY AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$123,000.00	\$82,000.00	06-23-025-106-006
01/27/16	15CV186964	40634	BUTTERNUT RIDGE RD	ELYRIA	\$159,000.00	\$115,000.00	10-00-013-000-210
01/27/16	15CV187119	429	ALDRICH ROAD	VERMILION	\$30,000.00	Cancelled	01-00-002-105-036 01-00-002-105-105
01/27/16	15CV187246	5782	BOXWOOD DRIVE	LORAIN	\$81,000.00	\$77,000.00	02-02-002-000-082
02/17/16	06TX005356	930	OBERLIN AVENUE	LORAIN		Cancelled	02-02-026-116-026
02/17/16	08CV159735	252	FAIRLAWN AVE	ELYRIA	\$72,000.00	Cancelled	06-25-015-109-018
02/17/16	08CV160087	620	NELSON ST	ELYRIA	\$81,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-004-105-021 10-00-004-105-022
02/17/16	08TX005808	693	GRANTWOOD AVENUE AND VACANT LOT SHEFFIELD LAKE			Cancelled	03-00-040-113-026 03-00-040-113-055
02/17/16	09TX006119	260	ESSEX ROAD	VERMILION		Cancelled	01-00-002-108-047 01-00-002-108-048 01-00-002-108-049
02/17/16	10TX006159	975	OSBORN AVENUE	LORAIN		No Bid	02-02-027-116-011
02/17/16	10TX006254	126	E 33RD ST	LORAIN		\$6,260.13	03-00-098-126-012
02/17/16	10TX006256	4306	MAPLE RD	LORAIN		No Bid	03-00-106-117-001 03-00-106-117-003
02/17/16	10TX006278	3275	G ST	LORAIN		No Bid	03-00-046-108-012
02/17/16	10TX006283	2100	EAST 28TH STREET	LORAIN		No Bid	03-00-085-104-001
02/17/16	10TX006306	916	PRINCETON AVENUE	AMHERST		\$65,000.00	05-00-040-110-010
02/17/16	10TX006312	1239	WEST ERIE AVENUE	LORAIN		No Bid	02-02-026-106-007
02/17/16	10TX006317		VACANTLAND ON NORTHERLY SIDE OF SPRUCE T	AMHERST		\$10,177.86	05-00-041-105-043 05-00-041-105-047
02/17/16	10TX006341	2107	ROOSEVELT AVENUE	LORAIN		Cancelled	03-00-109-115-007
02/17/16	10TX006359		VACANT LAND	EATON TWP		No Bid	11-00-093-102-041
02/17/16	10TX006368	4602	NORFOLK AVENUE	LORAIN		Cancelled	03-00-077-105-035
02/17/16	12CV176161	23926	WEST RIM DRIVE	COLUMBIA STATION	\$423,000.00	Cancelled	12-00-043-000-061

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office			Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
02/17/16	12CV178482	1913	WEST 20TH STREET	LORAIN	\$39,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-024-116-004
02/17/16	13CV181974	1174	LANCER DR	AMHERST	\$120,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-035-101-019
02/17/16	14CV182628	190	SOUTH MAIN STREET	OBERLIN	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	09-00-095-104-016
02/17/16	14CV183561	1203	WEST RIVER RD N UNIT C1	ELYRIA	\$54,000.00	\$39,500.00	06-24-171-704-007
02/17/16	14CV183893	35911	HANAMAR DRIVE	AVON	\$300,000.00	\$280,000.00	04-00-014-107-208
02/17/16	14CV183937	43496	WEBSTER RD	WELLINGTON	\$60,000.00	Cancelled	15-00-100-000-016
02/17/16	14CV184810	47	EDGEWOOD DRIVE	GRAFTON	\$72,000.00	\$55,000.00	10-00-015-110-024
02/17/16	14CV184876	12571	AVALON DR	GRAFTON	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	11-00-036-117-005
02/17/16	14CV185134	440	DELAWARE AVENUE	LORAIN	\$27,000.00	\$18,000.00	02-01-003-110-046
02/17/16	14CV185245	2289	G STREET	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	03-00-049-116-012
02/17/16	14CV185249	226	ERIEVIEW BOULEVARD	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$54,000.00	\$40,000.00	03-00-032-106-033
02/17/16	15CV185293	541	BON AIR AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$66,000.00	No Bid	06-25-022-102-010
02/17/16	15CV185448	6501	FOX TAIL LANE	AMHERST	\$114,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-058-000-159
02/17/16	15CV185690	116	SUNRISE DRIVE	AMHERST	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-022-105-002
02/17/16	15CV185721	4224	TALBOT LANE	LORAIN	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	03-00-079-121-026
02/17/16	15CV185971	504	ALEXIS DRIVE	ELYRIA	\$144,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-005-107-635
02/17/16	15CV186005	273	SUMNER STREET	OBERLIN	\$66,000.00	No Bid	09-00-096-109-025
02/17/16	15CV186176	4725	CHELSEA AVENUE	LORAIN	\$15,000.00	\$13,449.06	03-00-077-118-018
02/17/16	15CV186355	2234	EAST 34TH STREET	LORAIN	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	03-00-094-114-011
02/17/16	15CV186386	6124	WEST BREEZEWAY DR	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$183,000.00	\$141,500.00	07-00-032-000-311
02/17/16	15CV186577	22267	GORE ORPHANAGE ROAD	NEW LONDON	\$120,000.00	\$136,850.00	17-07-020-000-019
02/17/16	15CV186587	25285	SPRAGUE ROAD	COLUMBIA STATION	\$84,000.00	Cancelled	12-00-041-000-006
02/17/16	15CV186608	764	IRVING PARK BLVD	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$72,000.00	\$73,100.00	03-00-036-125-009
02/17/16	15CV186809	4006	NORFOLK AVENUE	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	03-00-079-105-012
02/17/16	15CV186857	6217	DEBRA DR	LORAIN	\$72,000.00	\$65,000.00	05-00-080-104-014
02/17/16	15CV186928	512	ARABIAN COURT	LAGRANGE	\$42,000.00	No Bid	15-00-098-108-215
02/17/16	15CV186966	17775	PITTS RD	WELLINGTON	\$111,000.00	\$144,100.00	14-00-107-000-012
02/17/16	15CV187232		VACANT LAND FORMERLY KNOWN AS 278 BELDO	AVON LAKE	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	04-00-018-116-006
02/17/16	15CV187268	229	WARDEN AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	06-24-034-109-007
02/17/16	15CV187315	242	KENSINGTON ROAD	VERMILION	\$42,000.00	Cancelled	01-00-003-110-015 01-00-003-110-037 01-00-003-110-016
02/17/16	15CV187370	504	FILLMORE AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$45,000.00	\$31,450.00	06-24-050-106-012
02/17/16	15CV187416	132	LAKESWOOD DR	AVON LAKE	\$33,000.00	\$26,000.00	04-00-030-123-004
02/17/16	15TX006537		VACANT LAND	AMHERST TWP		\$5,478.39	05-00-057-000-345
02/24/16	10TX006231	424	WEST 12TH ST	ELYRIA		No Bid	06-26-008-102-004
02/24/16	10TX006245	928	WEST 14TH STREET	LORAIN		Cancelled	02-01-006-127-029 02-01-006-127-030
02/24/16	10TX006334			ELYRIA		No Bid	06-26-070-000-013
02/24/16	10TX006374	9997	COLFAX AVENUE	COLUMBIA STATION		Cancelled	12-00-020-107-029
02/24/16	11CV172825	38471	AVALON DR	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$189,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-043-103-016
02/24/16	12CV178895	107	DRIFTWOOD COURT	ELYRIA	\$135,000.00	Cancelled	06-25-001-000-116
02/24/16	13CV180933	169	BROOK VALLEY	ELYRIA	\$60,000.00	Cancelled	06-23-025-107-015
02/24/16	13CV181063	2285	CLAUS ROAD	VERMILION	\$51,000.00	\$40,000.00	01-00-022-102-008 01-00-022-102-004

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office			Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
02/24/16	14CV184008	3918	OBERLIN AVE	LORAIN	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	02-02-015-118-028
02/24/16	14CV184452	5209	MANCHESTER CIRCLE	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$90,000.00	\$90,000.00	07-00-019-000-158
02/24/16	14CV184544	1324	DOUGLAS COURT	LORAIN	\$105,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-005-101-011
02/24/16	14CV185093	2521	E 32ND ST	LORAIN	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	03-00-082-112-019
02/24/16	14CV185095	2425	E 34TH ST	LORAIN	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	03-00-081-106-019
02/24/16	14CV185250	427	MORGAN COURT	LAGRANGE	\$63,000.00	Cancelled	15-00-098-108-125
02/24/16	15CV185327	917	EUCLID AVENUE	LORAIN	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	03-00-047-120-005
02/24/16	15CV185840	355	11TH STREET	ELYRIA	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	06-26-015-102-005
02/24/16	15CV185856	3604	ASHLAND AVENUE	LORAIN	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	02-02-015-108-017
02/24/16	15CV186136	709	ALAMEDA AVENUE	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$78,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-038-117-064 03-00-038-117-001
02/24/16	15CV187038	215	CRESTWOOD DRIVE	AVON LAKE	\$81,000.00	\$100,000.00	04-00-007-121-012
03/02/16	12CV175903	2319	ADAMS ST	LORAIN	\$44,000.00	\$29,333.00	03-00-055-101-011
03/02/16	14CV183170	37659	LAKE DRIVE	AVON	\$75,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-010-106-017
03/02/16	14CV184733	367	OLIVE STREET	ELYRIA	\$84,000.00	Cancelled	06-25-018-103-009
03/02/16	14CV184942	1109	WEST AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	06-26-016-102-046
03/02/16	14CV185094	2846	STERLING ROAD	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	03-00-047-119-008
03/02/16	15CV186035	3118	GRANT STREET	LORAIN	\$21,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-047-118-013
03/02/16	15CV186205	40228	SMITH ROAD	SPENCER	\$99,000.00	No Bid	19-01-025-000-012
03/02/16	15CV186211	38835	BUTTERNUT RIDGE ROAD	ELYRIA	\$99,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-006-120-061
03/02/16	15CV186293	973	OLIVER STREET	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$54,000.00	\$75,798.00	03-00-042-118-078
03/02/16	15CV186584	233	NEBRASKA AVE	LORAIN	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	03-00-048-103-021
03/02/16	15CV186724	1021	PLYMOUTH DRIVE	GRAFTON	\$96,000.00	\$64,100.00	11-00-082-000-088
03/02/16	15CV186768	145	ORCHARD HILL DRIVE	AMHERST	\$183,000.00	\$165,100.00	05-00-038-107-016
03/02/16	15CV186779	315	PRINCETON AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	06-25-073-105-010
03/02/16	15CV187706	125	WOODVIEW DR	ELYRIA	\$117,000.00	\$78,000.00	06-23-025-105-038
03/02/16	15TX006555	148	BELL AVENUE	ELYRIA		\$5,827.19	06-24-027-102-027
03/09/16	08CV156230	2726	CAROLINE AVE	LORAIN	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	03-00-098-102-012
03/09/16	12CV175280	1025	NORTH QUARRY ROAD	AMHERST	\$282,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-098-000-085
03/09/16	12CV177585	2581	HOMEWOOD DRIVE	LORAIN	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	03-00-079-104-013
03/09/16	12CV177744	34947	FAIRWAY DRIVE	AVON	\$162,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-024-103-020
03/09/16	13CV181908	36157	BEHM RD	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$120,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-027-101-090
03/09/16	13CV181939	40500	WEBSTER RD	LAGRANGE	\$174,000.00	\$116,000.00	15-00-095-000-041
03/09/16	14CV182370	222	WOOSTER STREET	ELYRIA	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	06-26-011-102-013 06-26-011-102-014
03/09/16	14CV183848	4221	PRINCESS ANNE COURT	LORAIN	\$75,000.00	\$50,100.00	02-01-008-101-302
03/09/16	14CV184411	3427	DALLAS AVENUE	LORAIN		\$9,000.00	03-00-097-120-004 03-00-097-120-003
03/09/16	14CV184638	792	WILDBERRY CIRCLE	AVON LAKE	\$150,000.00	\$148,750.00	04-00-017-802-029
03/09/16	14CV185012	5828	TREE MOSS LANE	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$120,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-005-104-016
03/09/16	14CV185101	33756	GAIL DR	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$108,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-009-120-111
03/09/16	15CV185424	1733	EAST 29TH ST	LORAIN	\$12,000.00	\$8,000.00	03-00-096-108-038
03/09/16	15CV185437	16	LANDINGS WAY	AVON LAKE	\$90,000.00	\$61,000.00	04-00-018-700-016
03/09/16	15CV185951	132	CHASE STREET	ELYRIA	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	06-25-102-000-007
03/09/16	15CV186142	2000	WEST 39TH STREET	LORAIN	\$60,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-014-112-023

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office			Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
03/09/16	15CV186358	519	AUGDON DRIVE	ELYRIA	\$69,000.00	\$46,100.00	06-25-023-107-009
03/09/16	15CV186385	337	HARVARD AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	06-25-005-110-014
03/09/16	15CV186411	2208	JACKSON ST	LORAIN	\$42,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-049-122-020
03/09/16	15CV186547	204	RESERVE CIRCLE	WELLINGTON	\$90,000.00	\$70,000.00	18-00-026-803-005
03/09/16	15CV186559	4003	TEMPLE AVENUE	LORAIN	\$84,000.00	\$56,000.00	02-02-014-115-012
03/09/16	15CV186651	4022	LORAIN AVENUE	LORAIN	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	03-00-106-107-001
03/09/16	15CV186889	3294	LEAVITT ROAD	LORAIN	\$81,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-013-101-029
03/09/16	15CV186946	747	HOLLYWOOD AVENUE	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	03-00-039-118-054
03/09/16	15CV187288	221	HAYES AVE	ELYRIA	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	06-24-051-102-004
03/09/16	15CV187541	9930	STATION ROAD	COLUMBIA STATION	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	12-00-080-000-021 12-00-080-000-031
03/09/16	15CV187590	6034	EMERALD ST	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$144,000.00	\$105,000.00	07-00-017-128-122
03/16/16	09TX006020		VACANILOT FORMERLY KNOWN AS 121 TANNER'	ELYRIA		No Bid	06-26-087-000-004
03/16/16	10TX006237		VACANILAND FORMERLY KNOWN AS 406 WEST 2'	LORAIN		No Bid	02-01-003-192-024
03/16/16	10TX006243		VACANILAND FORMERLY KNOWN AS 503 WEST 2'	LORAIN		No Bid	02-01-003-161-007
03/16/16	14CV184857	5265	WALLACE BOULEVARD	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$78,000.00	\$52,000.00	07-00-018-105-005 07-00-018-105-161
03/16/16	14CV185099	555	KANSAS AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$87,000.00	\$77,000.00	10-00-005-102-076
03/16/16	14CV185133	237	FAIRFIELD RD	AVON LAKE	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-018-111-011
03/16/16	14CV185183	131	GRAYBARK LANE	AMHERST	\$105,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-059-106-073
03/16/16	14CV185216	203	LEAR ROAD	AVON LAKE		\$46,328.00	04-00-030-121-015
03/16/16	15CV185374	441	ADAMS ST	ELYRIA	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	06-24-069-103-004
03/16/16	15CV185548	10199	BRYANT AVENUE	COLUMBIA STATION	\$78,000.00	\$52,000.00	12-00-020-114-011 12-00-020-114-012
03/16/16	15CV185922	195	BEACHWOOD AVENUE	AVON LAKE	\$141,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-007-129-003
03/16/16	15CV186432	4846	MILLS CREEK LN	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$99,000.00	\$66,000.00	07-00-007-702-011
03/16/16	15CV187033	484	MILAN AVENUE	AMHERST	\$105,000.00	\$70,000.00	05-00-017-000-147 05-00-017-000-165
03/16/16	15CV187421	1050	BELL AVE	ELYRIA	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	06-24-026-101-006
03/16/16	15TX006540	1863	LIBERTY AVENUE	VERMILION		No Bid	01-00-006-102-022
03/16/16	15TX006608-001			VERMILION		No Bid	01-00-004-119-001 01-00-004-119-002 01-00-004-119-003 01-00-004-119-004 01-00-004-119-005 01-00-004-119-006 01-00-004-119-051 01-00-004-119-052
03/16/16	15TX006608-003			SHEFFIELD LAKE		No Bid	03-00-030-104-003
03/16/16	15TX006608-024			VERMILION		No Bid	01-00-006-101-024 01-00-006-101-031 01-00-006-101-032 01-00-006-101-033 01-00-006-101-002
03/16/16	15TX006608-066	350	ROXBORO ROAD	VERMILION		\$20,400.00	01-00-002-110-066

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office			Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
03/23/16	10TX006247		VACANT LOT	LORAIN		No Bid	02-01-003-146-002
03/23/16	10TX006338		VACANT LOT FORMERLY KNOWN AS 331 11TH ST	ELYRIA		No Bid	06-26-015-103-012
03/23/16	14CV183524	7083	OAK TREE DRIVE NORTH	LORAIN	\$150,000.00	Cancelled	02-03-007-000-162
03/23/16	14CV183857	38751	SUGAR RIDGE ROAD	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$54,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-047-000-022
03/23/16	14CV184395	718	ARLINGTON DRIVE	VERMILION	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	01-00-004-125-024
03/23/16	14CV185246	520	WEST 14TH STREET	LORAIN	\$3,000.00	\$2,000.00	02-01-003-131-026
03/23/16	15CV185385	139	LONGFORD AVE	ELYRIA	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	06-25-019-111-002
03/23/16	15CV185594	1617	WEST 19TH STREET	LORAIN	\$51,000.00	No Bid	02-02-025-115-031
03/23/16	15CV185612	415	PROSPECT STREET	WELLINGTON	\$72,000.00	Cancelled	18-00-026-103-001
03/23/16	15CV185693	1162	BELL AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	06-24-025-101-008
03/23/16	15CV185769	14260	COWLEY RD	COLUMBIA STATION	\$120,000.00	\$160,000.00	11-00-020-000-004
03/23/16	15CV185921	248	SPRINGBROOK CIRCLE	ELYRIA	\$150,000.00	\$110,000.00	06-24-015-000-073
03/23/16	15CV186153	38000	ROYALTON ROAD	GRAFTON	\$120,000.00	\$80,000.00	11-00-095-000-036
03/23/16	15CV186214	101	WEST LINCOLN STREET	OBERLIN	\$90,000.00	\$61,200.00	09-00-095-108-013
03/23/16	15CV186560	1961	EAST 34TH STREET	LORAIN	\$39,000.00	\$51,375.36	03-00-095-113-037
03/23/16	15CV186620	195	LEAR RD	AVON LAKE	\$75,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-030-121-010
03/23/16	15CV186957	345	NORTH PROFESSOR STREET	OBERLIN	\$99,000.00	Cancelled	09-00-075-107-002
03/23/16	15CV186987	451	WEST RIVER RD	ELYRIA	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	06-24-123-000-008
03/23/16	15CV187079	249	LINCOLN ST	AMHERST	\$75,000.00	\$102,000.00	05-00-023-111-022 05-00-023-111-023
03/23/16	15CV187116	4386	EAST LAKE RD AKA LAKE RD	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	03-00-039-104-009 03-00-039-104-008 03-00-039-104-013
03/23/16	15CV187164	35268	GREENWICH AVENUE #115	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$60,000.00	\$73,000.00	07-00-019-703-019
03/23/16	15CV187501	1231	W 28TH ST	LORAIN	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	02-02-016-112-011
03/23/16	15CV187516	880	SHEFFIELD ROAD	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	03-00-041-118-062
03/23/16	15TX006550	1150	MILAN AVE & 6 SURROUNDING ADJACEN	AMHERST		Cancelled	05-00-004-102-006 05-00-004-102-004 05-00-004-102-005 05-00-004-101-009 05-00-004-103-018 05-00-004-101-006 05-00-004-101-005
04/06/16	12CV175757	33624	SAINT FRANCIS DR	AVON	\$360,000.00	\$343,000.00	04-00-024-113-046
04/06/16	12CV177014	32380	NOTTINGHAM DRIVE	AVON LAKE	\$660,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-019-143-284
04/06/16	14CV184545	342	BOUNTY WAY	AVON LAKE	\$342,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-030-144-014
04/06/16	14CV184627	1531	EAST 31ST ST	LORAIN	\$33,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-097-111-053
04/06/16	14CV184933	2556	SHAKESPEARE LANE	AVON		\$38,100.00	04-00-022-801-012 04-00-022-801-125
04/06/16	15CV185292	4628	FIELDS WAY	LORAIN	\$129,000.00	\$140,000.00	02-02-010-000-302
04/06/16	15CV185473	26672	OSBORNE RD	COLUMBIA STATION	\$192,000.00	\$167,200.00	12-00-079-000-026
04/06/16	15CV185895	444	CLINTON AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	06-24-027-116-030
04/06/16	15CV186092	367	SOUTH MAIN STREET	OBERLIN	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	09-00-096-104-005 09-00-096-104-006
04/06/16	15CV186243	364	HICKORY RUN	LAGRANGE	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	15-00-098-107-018

Sale Date	Case Number		Lorain County Sheriff's Office		Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
04/06/16	15CV186292	42248	MEADOW LANE	LAGRANGE TWP	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	15-00-083-101-007
04/06/16	15CV186560-003	1047	HAMILTON AVENUE	LORAIN	\$18,000.00	\$36,710.47	02-01-006-118-003
04/06/16	15CV186684	10035	EAST RIVER ROAD	ELYRIA	\$102,000.00	\$68,000.00	10-00-004-142-025
04/06/16	15CV186739	646	HIGH STREET	ELYRIA	\$60,000.00	Cancelled	06-24-023-104-001
04/06/16	15CV186983	2439	REID AVENUE	LORAIN	\$24,000.00	\$16,000.00	02-01-003-179-016
04/06/16	15CV187057	2562	EAST 42ND ST	LORAIN	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	03-00-079-118-002
04/06/16	15CV187137	904	WEST 23RD STREET	LORAIN	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	02-01-006-154-024
04/06/16	15CV187342	1605	WEST 23RD STREET	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	02-02-016-104-006
04/06/16	15CV187589	530	CAROL LANE	ELYRIA	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-005-102-151
04/06/16	15CV187662	389	QUARTER HORSE LANE	LAGRANGE		Cancelled	
04/06/16	15CV187670	4310	CARR PLACE	LORAIN	\$57,000.00	\$40,800.00	02-02-006-108-016
04/13/16	13CV179346	613	BLOSSOM DRIVE	LORAIN	\$24,000.00	\$57,750.00	03-00-046-110-001
04/13/16	14CV182628	190	S MAIN ST	OBERLIN	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	09-00-095-104-016
04/13/16	14CV184778	41430	BUTTERNUT RIDGE ROAD	ELYRIA		\$70,000.00	10-00-013-000-123 10-00-013-000-163
04/13/16	14CV185230	38966	EAST RIVER RD	ELYRIA	\$42,000.00	\$40,500.00	10-00-005-107-050
04/13/16	15CV185446	23723	PARKWOOD DR	COLUMBIA STATION	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	12-00-020-121-004
04/13/16	15CV186005	273	SUMNER STREET	OBERLIN	\$66,000.00	Cancelled	09-00-096-109-025
04/13/16	15CV186196	34410	WEST POINT DRIVE	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$90,000.00	\$154,223.83	07-00-015-105-021
04/13/16	15CV186783	7330	WEST RIVER RD S	ELYRIA	\$27,000.00	Cancelled	06-24-007-105-005
04/13/16	15CV186891	717	PARK AVE	AMHERST	\$132,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-038-104-036
04/13/16	15CV186901	1212	WEST 8TH STREET	LORAIN	\$48,000.00	\$32,400.00	02-02-026-112-023
04/13/16	15CV186944	5351	COLORADO AVENUE	SHEFFIELD VILLAGE	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	03-00-007-101-059
04/13/16	15CV187019	406	LONG ST	AMHERST	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	05-00-018-101-029
04/13/16	15CV187117	11704	WEST RIDGE ROAD	ELYRIA	\$120,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-011-101-004
04/13/16	15CV187210	2583	EAST 40TH STREET	LORAIN	\$42,000.00	\$33,541.56	03-00-080-110-021
04/13/16	15CV187226	39372	CHESTNUT RIDGE RD	ELYRIA	\$165,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-005-101-392
04/13/16	15CV187319	191	BEEBE AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	06-25-020-108-012
04/13/16	15CV187662	389	QUARTER HORSE LANE	LAGRANGE	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	15-00-098-108-088 15-00-098-108-089
04/13/16	15CV187726	1328	WEST 7TH ST	LORAIN	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	02-02-026-109-017
04/13/16	15CV187788	2324	STONEPATH ST	LORAIN	\$69,000.00	\$68,700.00	02-02-024-109-012
04/20/16	10TX006189			LORAIN		No Bid	03-00-103-121-018
04/20/16	10TX006190		COMMOKNOWN AS TWO VACANT LOTS	LORAIN		No Bid	03-00-103-121-021 03-00-103-121-020
04/20/16	10TX006266			LORAIN		No Bid	03-00-098-128-009 03-00-098-128-010
04/20/16	10TX006273		COMMOKNOWN AS VACANT LOT	LORAIN		No Bid	03-00-098-106-018
04/20/16	10TX006299	871	HOWELL STREET	SHEFFIELD LAKE		No Bid	03-00-042-114-016
04/20/16	10TX006301			LORAIN		No Bid	02-02-026-111-019
04/20/16	11CV174294	365	DELLWOOD ROAD	AVON LAKE	\$63,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-018-122-012
04/20/16	13CV179161	337	BROAD ST	ELYRIA		No Bid	06-26-082-000-010
04/20/16	14CV184539	334	WEST RIVER RD NORTH	ELYRIA	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	06-24-103-000-012 06-24-103-000-011
04/20/16	14CV184584	220	SOUTHWOOD DRIVE	ELYRIA	\$93,000.00	No Bid	10-00-004-127-012

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office			Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
04/20/16	14CV184831	5316	CAREK COURT	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-113-107-026
04/20/16	15CV185406	144	AVON POINT AVENUE	AVON LAKE	\$75,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-019-105-039
04/20/16	15CV185410	888	LIVERMORE LN	ELYRIA	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	06-25-027-101-027
04/20/16	15CV185579	318	IDAHO AVE	LORAIN	\$45,000.00	Cancelled	02-01-003-107-050
04/20/16	15CV186413	1408	WEST 11TH STREET	LORAIN	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	02-02-027-116-030
04/20/16	15CV186778	3265	COOPER FOSTER PARK ROAD	VERMILION	\$252,000.00	Cancelled	01-00-036-000-046
04/20/16	15CV187068	102	WEST HAMILTON STREET	OBERLIN	\$60,000.00	Cancelled	09-00-095-108-051
04/20/16	15CV187306	6510	BUTTERCUP LANE	LORAIN	\$153,000.00	Cancelled	05-00-001-000-160
04/20/16	15CV187671	8778	OBERLIN RD	ELYRIA	\$90,000.00	\$70,000.00	05-00-052-000-008
04/20/16	15CV188067	460	10TH STREET	ELYRIA	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	06-26-016-101-012
04/27/16	09TX0006137			ELYRIA		No Bid	06-26-023-101-001
04/27/16	10TX0006284		VACANTLAND FORMERLY KNOWN AS 219 EAST 29	LORAIN		No Bid	03-00-098-103-024
04/27/16	10TX0006381		A VACA/PARCEL OF LAND	ELYRIA		No Bid	06-24-056-000-019
04/27/16	12CV178596	35129	DRAKE STREET NORTH	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$99,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-020-119-012 07-00-020-119-013
04/27/16	13CV180933	169	BROOK VALLEY	ELYRIA	\$60,000.00	Cancelled	06-23-025-107-015
04/27/16	14CV184733	367	OLIVE STREET	ELYRIA	\$84,000.00	\$56,000.00	06-25-018-103-009
04/27/16	14CV184884	45520	NORTH RIDGE RD	AMHERST	\$81,000.00	\$54,000.00	05-00-059-101-003 05-00-059-101-016
04/27/16	14CV184917	6095	GREENVIEW TRAIL	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$141,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-032-000-459
04/27/16	14CV185250	427	MORGAN COURT	LAGRANGE	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	15-00-098-108-125
04/27/16	15CV185408	5610	GARGASZ DRIVE	LORAIN	\$84,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-004-109-030
04/27/16	15CV185436	45051	NEW LONDON EASTERN RD	HUNTINGTON TWP	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	21-08-002-000-010
04/27/16	15CV185523	4356	BROCKLEY AVENUE	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$45,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-029-106-028
04/27/16	15CV185817	493	WINDWARD WAY	AVON LAKE	\$324,000.00	\$294,000.00	04-00-030-153-004
04/27/16	15CV186032	5611	INDEPENDENCE DRIVE	LORAIN	\$69,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-004-108-008
04/27/16	15CV186268	38715	HIDDEN CANYON DRIVE	GRAFTON	\$84,000.00	\$87,000.00	15-00-072-000-045
04/27/16	15CV186269	109	NEBRASKA AVE	ELYRIA	\$78,000.00	\$61,000.00	10-00-005-111-002
04/27/16	15CV186437	734	ALLISON AVENUE	LORAIN	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	02-02-027-110-023
04/27/16	15CV186610	13631	HAWKE ROAD	COLUMBIA STATION	\$39,000.00	\$45,200.00	12-00-096-000-005
04/27/16	15CV186877	1617	W 9TH ST	LORAIN	\$75,000.00	No Bid	02-02-027-114-001
04/27/16	15CV187007	3823	TACOMA AVE	LORAIN	\$54,000.00	\$38,000.00	03-00-080-111-001
04/27/16	15CV187058	34453	LAUREL WAY	AVON	\$333,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-024-116-024
04/27/16	15CV187524	4788	DETROIT RD	ELYRIA	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	03-00-074-104-014 03-00-074-104-057
04/27/16	15CV187542	2727	WEST 37TH STREET	LORAIN	\$75,000.00	\$60,000.00	02-02-012-108-004
04/27/16	15CV187638	12350	ISLAND ROAD	GRAFTON	\$45,000.00	Cancelled	11-00-036-115-036
04/27/16	15CV187669	111	FOREST HILL DRIVE	AVON LAKE	\$93,000.00	\$80,000.00	04-00-018-139-008
04/27/16	15CV187882	4609	GARY AVE	LORAIN	\$54,000.00	\$37,100.00	03-00-077-109-003
04/27/16	15CV187910	163	SOUTH LEAVETT ROAD	AMHERST		Cancelled	05-00-043-102-009
04/27/16	15CV188110	254	BRANDTSON AVE	ELYRIA	\$99,000.00	Cancelled	06-25-034-101-012
04/27/16	15CV188146	5800	DEBORAH DRIVE	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$90,000.00	\$62,500.00	07-00-017-104-024
05/04/16	08CV155849	101	MEANDER LANE	ELYRIA			06-24-003-801-005
05/04/16	09TX0006106	3170	ROANOKE DRIVE	VERMILION		\$38,100.00	01-00-004-120-035
05/04/16	12CV177533	424	10TH ST	ELYRIA	\$45,000.00	Cancelled	06-26-016-101-023

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office			Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
05/04/16	14CV183892	1322	MAPLE DRIVE	LORAIN	\$36,000.00	\$24,120.00	03-00-057-103-037
05/04/16	14CV184478	901	ROOT RD	LORAIN		\$17,547.75	03-00-031-105-009
05/04/16	14CV184544	1324	DOUGLAS COURT	LORAIN	\$105,000.00	\$70,000.00	02-02-005-101-011
05/04/16	14CV184547	37333	STONE CREEK DRIVE	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$159,000.00	\$140,000.00	07-00-032-000-158
05/04/16	14CV184582	12563	ALTON DRIVE	GRAFTON	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	11-00-036-118-005
05/04/16	14CV185223	302	BERKSHIRE ROAD	VERMILION	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	01-00-003-108-069
05/04/16	14TX006409	1949	BROADWAY	LORAIN		No Bid	02-01-003-158-003 02-01-003-158-004 02-01-003-158-005 02-01-003-158-006
05/04/16	15CV185307	4273	SANTINA WAY	LORAIN	\$141,000.00	\$130,000.00	02-02-010-000-186
05/04/16	15CV186154	4739	TOLEDO AVENUE	LORAIN	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	03-00-108-111-031
05/04/16	15CV186295	34814	CHESTNUT RIDGE ROAD	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$129,000.00	\$86,000.00	07-00-014-101-005 07-00-014-101-006
05/04/16	15CV186884	220	WENNER ST	WELLINGTON	\$81,000.00	Cancelled	18-00-028-104-086
05/04/16	15CV187021	3326	CAMDEN AVENUE	LORAIN	\$15,000.00	\$10,000.00	03-00-081-113-011
05/04/16	15CV187023	41517	NORTH RIDGE RD	ELYRIA	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	06-22-018-116-015 06-22-018-116-014 06-22-018-116-013
05/04/16	15CV187148	4014	WOODWORTH DRIVE	LORAIN	\$120,000.00	\$80,000.00	02-02-011-000-026
05/04/16	15CV187369	5340	BOND AVE	LORAIN	\$18,000.00	\$12,000.00	03-00-075-109-014 03-00-075-109-034
05/04/16	15CV187388	33853	PATTON DR	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$48,000.00	\$55,000.00	07-00-010-103-005
05/04/16	15CV187438	1848	EAST 34TH STREET	LORAIN	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	03-00-095-107-009
05/04/16	15CV187452	3195	LINCOLN ST	LORAIN	\$33,000.00	\$22,100.00	03-00-046-117-021
05/04/16	15CV187474	423	PEMBERTON DR	ELYRIA	\$162,000.00	\$125,000.00	10-00-005-107-487
05/04/16	15CV187490	522	FOSTER AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	06-24-066-102-002
05/04/16	15CV187551	5715	WALLACE BOULEVARD	NORTH RIDGEVILLE	\$45,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-017-116-004 07-00-017-116-005 07-00-017-116-006 07-00-017-116-007 07-00-017-116-008 07-00-017-116-009 07-00-017-116-026
05/04/16	15CV187582	1044	WOODLAND CHASE	GRAFTON	\$219,000.00	Cancelled	11-00-099-000-289
05/04/16	15CV187625	810	EAST DR	SHEFFIELD LAKE	\$39,000.00	\$37,000.00	03-00-043-114-041
05/04/16	15CV187658	643	HARVARD AVENUE	ELYRIA	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	06-25-006-117-012
05/04/16	15CV187880	2916	SPRUCE COURT	LORAIN	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	02-02-017-117-018
05/04/16	15CV187910	163	SOUTH LEAVITT ROAD	AMHERST	\$99,000.00	\$72,000.00	05-00-043-102-009
05/04/16	15CV188123	45343	PECK WADSWORTH ROAD	WELLINGTON	\$84,000.00	Cancelled	18-00-020-000-067
05/04/16	15CV188203	2722	EAST ERIE AVENUE	LORAIN	\$60,000.00	\$47,000.00	03-00-048-103-003
05/04/16	15CV188250	636	HIGH STREET	ELYRIA	\$75,000.00	\$52,650.00	06-24-023-104-003
05/04/16	15TX006621			ELYRIA		No Bid	06-23-014-000-017 06-23-016-101-007