

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office	Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
1/10/2018	11CV171580	845 Horseshoe Way Avon Lake, Oh 44012	\$240,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-029-000-667
1/10/2018	12CV176338	879 Timberview Drive Amherst, Oh 44001	\$252,000.00	\$210,500.00	05-00-040-109-025
1/10/2018	12CV178512	38991 Waverly Drive Avon, Oh 44011	\$270,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-002-102-163
1/10/2018	13CV181537	2325 East 32Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44055	\$39,000.00	\$33,000.00	03-00-082-104-018
1/10/2018	15CV188041	2207 West 41St Street Lorain, Oh 44053	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	02-02-007-104-027
1/10/2018	16CV189529	6228 Oak Point Estates Lorain, Oh 44052	\$300,000.00	\$295,100.00	02-03-007-000-049
1/10/2018	16CV189893	36076 Astoria Way Avon, Oh 44011	\$282,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-013-000-303
1/10/2018	16CV190168	1604 West 38Th Street Lorain, Oh 44053	\$72,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-015-111-009
1/10/2018	16CV190789	5889 West Breezeway Drive North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$165,000.00	\$164,000.00	07-00-032-000-263
1/10/2018	16CV191081	4012 Kenyon Avenue Lorain, Oh 44053	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	02-02-013-112-004
1/10/2018	17CV191418	5897 Ridgeview Boulevard North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$126,000.00	\$110,000.00	07-00-020-117-025 07-00-020-117-026
1/10/2018	17CV191450	5960 Eastview Street North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$108,000.00	\$112,480.00	07-00-020-117-053 07-00-020-117-054
1/10/2018	17CV191567	504 Arabian Court Lagrange, Oh 44050	\$60,000.00	\$86,339.00	15-00-098-108-206
1/10/2018	17CV191602	348 11Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.01	06-26-015-103-008
1/10/2018	17CV191611	3675-3677 Gary Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	03-00-080-101-003
1/10/2018	17CV191764	263 Courtland Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$45,000.00	\$37,600.00	06-24-025-102-025
1/10/2018	17CV192389	850 Oakwood Drive Elyria, Oh 44035	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	06-24-026-109-004
1/10/2018	17CV192421	8195 Avon Belden Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$117,000.00	\$85,000.00	07-00-023-101-073
1/10/2018	17CV192744	127 Brace Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	06-24-035-105-012
1/10/2018	17CV192813	1733 East 34Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055	\$24,000.00	\$16,000.00	03-00-096-113-033
1/10/2018	17CV192822	4207 Norfolk Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$42,000.00	\$42,560.00	03-00-079-121-010
1/10/2018	17TX006855	2542 East 33Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44055		\$26,500.00	03-00-081-110-011
1/24/2018	10CV170414	733 Abbe Road N Elyria, Oh 44035	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	06-25-028-101-078
1/24/2018	13CV181627	230 Magyar Street Wellington, Oh 44090	\$93,000.00	\$85,000.00	18-00-027-105-027
1/24/2018	14CV184344	718 Waterberry Court Avon Lake, Oh 44012	\$192,000.00	\$175,000.00	04-00-017-801-006
1/24/2018	14CV185247	252 West College Street Oberlin, Oh 44074	\$99,000.00	Cancelled	09-00-085-101-029
1/24/2018	15CV186928	512 Arabian Court Lagrange, Oh 44050		\$15,100.00	15-00-098-108-215
1/24/2018	15CV187735	45320 Telegraph Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$90,000.00	\$81,000.00	05-00-053-000-005
1/24/2018	16CV189044	6482 Lear Nagle Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$171,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-009-113-062 07-00-009-113-024
1/24/2018	16CV189099	135 Beebe Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$78,000.00	Cancelled	06-25-020-108-027
1/24/2018	16CV189403	4217 Talbot Lane Lorain, Oh 44055	\$42,000.00	\$30,300.00	03-00-079-122-010

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office	Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
1/24/2018	16CV189575	8001 Oak Tree Drive South Lorain, Oh 44053	\$147,000.00	\$116,000.00	02-03-007-000-123
1/24/2018	16CV190356	935 G Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$33,000.00	\$25,200.00	02-00-051-128-005
1/24/2018	17CV191302	4870 Toledo Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	03-00-113-105-019
1/24/2018	17CV191326	218 Boston Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$69,000.00	Cancelled	06-25-013-110-006
1/24/2018	17CV191355	521 Maplewood Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$96,000.00	\$75,000.00	03-00-038-110-055
1/24/2018	17CV192169	44765 Telegraph Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$111,000.00	\$74,000.00	05-00-068-000-015
1/24/2018	17CV192184	740 West 18Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	10-00-003-106-012
1/24/2018	17CV192410	265 Hilliard Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$78,000.00	\$60,000.00	06-25-032-105-013
1/24/2018	17CV192544	307 Longfellow Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$90,000.00	\$84,000.00	06-25-021-104-019 06-25-021-104-038
1/24/2018	17CV192688	6 Whitaker Cove Avon Lake, Oh 44012	\$162,000.00	\$150,000.00	04-00-008-703-003
1/24/2018	17CV193195	4522 Norfolk Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$48,000.00	\$32,100.00	03-00-078-116-032
1/24/2018	17TX006806	3238 - 3242 Norfolk Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055		\$14,099.54	03-00-081-114-019
2/7/2018	12CV177298	1623 West 22Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$33,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-025-124-002
2/7/2018	13CV179957	34126 Gem Circle North Ridgeville, Oh 44039		Cancelled	07-00-018-101-124
2/7/2018	15CV188202	931 Dillewood Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$72,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-044-111-006
2/7/2018	16CV190382	5629 Lear Nagle Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$120,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-007-126-020 07-00-007-126-021
2/7/2018	16CV190723	3010 And 3012 Larkmoor Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$33,000.00	\$22,100.00	03-00-056-109-028
2/7/2018	16TX006676	144 East Bridge Street Elyria, Oh 44035		\$80,000.00	06-26-102-000-005
2/7/2018	17CV191435	5562 Pleasant Avenue North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$93,000.00	Sale Vacated	07-00-007-128-058
2/7/2018	17CV191536	4218 Palm Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$48,000.00	\$35,000.00	03-00-079-114-007
2/7/2018	17CV191537	120 Middle Street Wellington, Oh 44090	\$48,000.00	\$57,000.00	18-00-028-111-007
2/7/2018	17CV191646	122 Elyria Avenue Amherst, Oh 44001	\$105,000.00	\$91,000.00	05-00-024-122-043, 05-00-024-122-004
2/7/2018	17CV191695	1723 Tait Street Lorain, Oh 44053	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	02-02-023-108-015
2/7/2018	17CV192147	4403 Tacoma Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	03-00-078-115-001
2/7/2018	17CV192170	141 Pinewood Drive Elyria, Oh 44035	\$108,000.00	Cancelled	06-25-086-102-006
2/7/2018	17CV192251	1933 East 41St Street Lorain, Oh 44055	\$36,000.00	No Bid	\$23,622.65 03-00-100-117-009
2/7/2018	17CV192373	12488 Avalon Drive Grafton, Oh 44044	\$60,000.00	Cancelled	11-00-036-113-041
2/7/2018	17CV193174	705 East College Street Oberlin, Oh 44074	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	09-00-088-103-006
2/21/2018	15CV187169	12457 Eaton Boulevard Grafton, Oh 44044	\$48,000.00	Cancelled	11-00-036-113-019
2/21/2018	15CV187559	1301 New Hampshire Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052	\$51,000.00	\$51,400.00	03-00-055-108-001
2/21/2018	16CV188669	200 Habant Drive Amherst, Oh 44001	\$120,000.00	\$80,000.00	02-02-001-104-011
2/21/2018	16CV190011	126 Morgan Street Oberlin, Oh 44074	\$165,000.00	No Bid	\$25,400.00 09-00-085-109-026
2/21/2018	16CV190380	225 Berkshire Road Avon Lake, Oh 44012	\$132,000.00	Cancelled	04-00-018-112-007

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office	Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
2/21/2018	17CV191520	199 Beachwood Avenue Avon Lake, Oh 44012	\$150,000.00	\$175,100.00	04-00-007-129-004
2/21/2018	17CV191585	216 Clinton Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$24,000.00	\$20,000.00	06-24-027-111-012
2/21/2018	17CV191649	2558 Palmer Lane Avon, Oh 44011	\$414,000.00	\$396,100.00	04-00-022-103-085
2/21/2018	17CV191886	420 Kenyon Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$54,000.00	\$45,000.00	06-25-071-104-008
2/21/2018	17CV191984	2455 Larkmoor Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	03-00-055-102-015
2/21/2018	17CV192225	3300 Meister Road Lorain, Oh 44053	\$90,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-019-103-016
2/21/2018	17CV192333	1217 West River Road Unit C2 Elyria, Oh 44035	\$63,000.00	\$67,269.12	06-24-171-700-007
2/21/2018	17CV192354	515 Vermont Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	06-25-032-115-006
2/21/2018	17CV192374	834 Maplewood Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$81,000.00	\$54,000.00	03-00-038-123-065
2/21/2018	17CV192484	1936 Homewood Drive Lorain, Oh 44055	\$42,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-100-109-009
2/21/2018	17CV192774	38009 Avalon Drive North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$189,000.00	\$233,000.00	07-00-042-115-076
2/21/2018	17CV192870	10667 Reed Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028	\$162,000.00	\$108,000.00	11-00-013-000-042
2/21/2018	17CV193107	837 Warwick Drive Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	03-00-043-110-007
2/21/2018	17CV193132	225 Boston Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	06-25-013-109-008 06-25-013-109-009
3/7/2018	16CV190837	1126 West 10Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	02-01-006-116-036
3/7/2018	16CV191185	123 Monroe Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$27,000.00	\$18,000.00	06-24-148-000-003
3/7/2018	16CV191246	3335 Reid Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$54,000.00	Cancelled	02-01-003-227-005
3/7/2018	16TX006651	301 West 34Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055		No Bid	02-01-003-233-008
3/7/2018	17CV191597	5185 Windsor Drive North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$189,000.00	\$190,000.00	07-00-042-116-031
3/7/2018	17CV191624	41613 Rosewood Street Elyria Township, Oh 44035	\$66,000.00	\$65,000.00	06-22-017-103-013
3/7/2018	17CV191705	253 Lincoln Street Amherst, Oh 44001	\$72,000.00	\$72,000.00	05-00-023-104-012
3/7/2018	17CV191986	600 Denison Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$72,000.00	\$54,000.00	06-25-006-123-016
3/7/2018	17CV192040	1694 Elfleda Street Lorain, Oh 44055	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	03-00-111-116-007
3/7/2018	17CV192186	35215 Downing Avenue North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$126,000.00	\$118,000.00	07-00-019-000-083
3/7/2018	17CV192193	348 16Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$27,000.00	Cancelled	10-00-003-116-009
3/7/2018	17CV192222	2598 Fackler Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$57,000.00	\$38,000.00	06-22-012-104-011
3/7/2018	17CV192256	4258 Laurel Road Lorain, Oh 44055	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	03-00-106-113-016 03-00-106-113-017
3/7/2018	17CV192366	1323 Michigan Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	03-00-049-122-006
3/7/2018	17CV192380	34707 Law Road Grafton, Oh 44044 Aka Vacant Lot	\$36,000.00	\$45,000.00	16-00-073-000-014
3/7/2018	17CV192426	2136 Middle Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$90,000.00	\$80,000.00	10-00-004-109-048
3/7/2018	17CV192605	706 Pasadena Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$75,000.00	\$76,100.00	03-00-039-118-027 03-00-039-118-028 03-00-039-118-029
3/7/2018	17CV192607	447 Cambridge Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$78,000.00	\$58,000.00	06-25-072-102-012

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office	Appraisal Amount	Sale Price	
3/7/2018	17CV193020	1506 West 12Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	02-02-027-119-025
3/7/2018	17TX006853	154 Groveland Street Oberlin, Oh 44074		\$15,500.00	09-00-086-110-050
3/7/2018	17TX006876	6068 Dorwood Drive Lorain, Oh 44055		\$34,031.93	05-00-080-102-009
3/7/2018	17TX006890	1315-1317 Massachusetts Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052		\$11,480.22	03-00-050-113-007
3/7/2018	17TX006894-105-005	Vacant Lot Located On The Easterly Side Of Maine Ave., Located Directly B		No Bid	03-00-053-105-005
3/7/2018	17TX006894-112-049	Vacant Lot Located On The Westerly Side Of Toledo Ave., Located Directly		No Bid	03-00-103-112-049
3/7/2018	17TX006894-126-011	Vacant Lot Located On The Southerly Side Of Harriet St., Between 906 Har		No Bid	03-00-103-126-011
3/7/2018	17TX006894-132-013	Vacant Lot Located On The Northeasterly Side Of Lexington Ave., Starting 1		No Bid	02-01-003-132-013
3/7/2018	17TX006900	518 West 18Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052		No Bid	02-01-003-144-023
3/7/2018	17TX006914	334 Princeton Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035		\$44,000.00	06-25-074-103-029
3/21/2018	12CV176557	2052 East 37Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055	\$60,000.00	\$40,200.00	03-00-099-102-008
3/21/2018	12CV177533	424 10Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	06-26-016-101-023
3/21/2018	13CV180989	Vacant Lot Fka 2060 Julia Avenue Avon, Oh 44011		\$20,100.00	04-00-010-108-010
3/21/2018	15CV187574	113 Beck Avenue Avon Lake, Oh 44012	\$108,000.00	\$110,000.00	04-00-019-113-002
3/21/2018	16CV188937	3506 Jaeger Road Lorain, Oh 44053	\$21,000.00	\$29,000.00	02-02-009-101-057
3/21/2018	16CV190459	12869 Hawke Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028	\$375,000.00	Cancelled	12-00-097-000-017
3/21/2018	16CV190519	2633 West 38Th Street Lorain, Oh 44053	\$99,000.00	Cancelled	02-02-013-107-002
3/21/2018	16CV190736	04-00-006-135-010 33441 Lake Road Avon Lake, Oh 44012 04-00-006-135	\$180,000.00	\$205,000.00	04-00-006-135-010 04-00-006-135-077 04-00-006-135-015
3/21/2018	16CV191239	8283 Rachel Lane North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$144,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-014-104-055
3/21/2018	17CV191360	724 Irving Park Boulevard Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$81,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-036-125-004
3/21/2018	17CV191613	2118 South West River Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$69,000.00	\$79,000.00	10-00-003-122-016
3/21/2018	17CV191701	3740 Toledo Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	03-00-103-112-045
3/21/2018	17CV191891	2831 Colorado Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052	\$39,000.00	Cancelled	03-00-056-121-025
3/21/2018	17CV192163	910 West 20Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	02-01-006-142-030
3/21/2018	17CV192174	3201 Lorain Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	01-00-004-108-009 01-00-004-108-016
3/21/2018	17CV192187	928 Howard Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$108,000.00	\$72,000.00	06-25-026-107-058
3/21/2018	17CV192334	6398 Mills Creek Lane North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$129,000.00	Cancelled	07-00-005-103-060
3/21/2018	17CV192886	1370 Rolling Meadows Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089	\$132,000.00	\$88,000.00	01-20-027-113-029
3/21/2018	17CV193071	1830 East 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055	\$33,000.00	\$26,600.00	03-00-095-102-002
3/21/2018	17TX006818	2823 Crehore Street Lorain, Oh 44052		No Bid	03-00-056-112-020
3/21/2018	17TX006883	2505 East 34Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055		\$15,100.00	03-00-081-110-014
3/21/2018	17TX006895	Vacant Parcel Of Land Located On The Southerly Side Of West 14Th Street		No Bid	02-01-003-135-009
3/21/2018	17TX006901	2323 Oberlin Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052		\$14,737.13	02-01-006-156-004

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office	Appraisal Amount	Sale Price
3/21/2018	17TX006906	Vacant Lot Located On The Easterly Side Of Vermont St Directly Between 2		\$15,000.00 19-04-049-000-002
3/21/2018	17TX006948	143 Cleveland Street Elyria, Oh 44035		No Bid 06-25-069-101-002
4/4/2018	15CV187965	110 Hornyak Street Amherst, Oh 44001	\$99,000.00	\$85,000.00 05-00-094-103-045
4/4/2018	16CV191168	225 Westwind Drive Unit 11 Avon Lake, Oh 44012	\$150,000.00	\$145,000.00 04-00-030-703-003
4/4/2018	16TX006748	4585 Broadway Lorain, Oh 44052		No Bid 03-00-108-106-046
4/4/2018	17CV191909	98 Hickory Hollow Drive Amherst, Oh 44001	\$213,000.00	\$200,000.00 05-00-005-103-044
4/4/2018	17CV192229	1100 Garford Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$81,000.00	\$92,300.00 06-25-004-114-004
4/4/2018	17CV192834	19054 Vermont Street Grafton, Oh 44044		Cancelled 15-00-091-000-011
4/4/2018	17CV193384	1204 Maple Drive Lorain, Oh 44052	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00 03-00-057-103-022
4/4/2018	17CV193420	149 Chesapeake Court Elyria, Oh 44035	\$117,000.00	Cancelled 06-24-003-102-051
4/4/2018	17CV193533	161 Boston Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00 06-25-013-106-002
4/4/2018	17CV193630	416 Illinois Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00 02-00-051-116-021
4/4/2018	17CV193868	5503 Virginia Drive Amherst, Oh 44001	\$111,000.00	\$92,000.00 05-00-060-102-006
4/4/2018	17TX006871	6225 West River Road Elyria, Oh 44035 And 32' X 120' Vacant Lot Located		No Bid 06-24-010-105-036, 06-24-010-105-037
4/4/2018	17TX006916	Two Vacant Parcels Of Land Located On The West Side Of Olive Ave., Dire		No Bid 07-00-017-121-048 07-00-017-121-049
4/18/2018	06CV144903	550 West 14Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052		02-01-003-131-024
4/18/2018	08CV156188	1623 Nevada Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052		03-00-055-119-005
4/18/2018	13CV179957	34126 Gem Circle North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$162,000.00	07-00-018-101-124
4/18/2018	15CV186213	4341 Linda Drive Vermilion, Oh 44089	\$300,000.00	01-00-017-000-230
4/18/2018	15CV187169	12457 Eaton Boulevard Grafton, Oh 44044	\$48,000.00	Cancelled 11-00-036-113-019
4/18/2018	16CV188890	153 Walnut Drive Amherst, Oh 44001	\$117,000.00	05-00-038-108-009
4/18/2018	16CV189044	6482 Lear Nagle Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$171,000.00	07-00-009-113-062 07-00-009-113-024
4/18/2018	16CV190126	163 Pearl Street Amherst, Oh 44001	\$93,000.00	Cancelled 05-00-023-120-008
4/18/2018	16CV190484	228 Warren Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035		Cancelled 06-25-015-110-010
4/18/2018	17CV191396	1730 Fairway Drive Lorain, Oh 44053	\$90,000.00	02-02-007-109-024
4/18/2018	17CV191600	643 Sunnyside Road Vermilion, Oh 44089	\$195,000.00	01-00-005-104-010
4/18/2018	17CV191949	4390 Jaycox Road Avon, Oh 44011	\$171,000.00	04-00-024-101-096
4/18/2018	17CV192204	546 North Center Street And 530-540 North Center Street Lagrange, Oh 440	\$3,510,000.00	Cancelled 15-00-035-000-098 15-00-035-000-270
4/18/2018	17CV192288	753 Abbe Road North Elyria, Oh 44035	\$72,000.00	06-23-030-103-003
4/18/2018	17CV192481	904 Delaware Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$60,000.00	06-25-002-102-050
4/18/2018	17CV192649	7104 Murray Ridge Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$81,000.00	06-24-044-105-009
4/18/2018	17CV192860	1224 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$33,000.00	02-02-016-103-013



Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office	Appraisal Amount	Sale Price
4/18/2018	17CV192890	1608 West 18Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$45,000.00	02-02-025-109-013
4/18/2018	17CV192907	9627 Patricia Court Elyria, Oh 44035	\$126,000.00	10-00-001-102-076
4/18/2018	17CV192969	322 Pasadena Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$54,000.00	06-25-017-102-017
4/18/2018	17CV193042	4126 Forestlawn Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$99,000.00	Cancelled 03-00-029-101-006 03-00-029-101-007 03-00-029-101-008
4/18/2018	17CV193172	6465 Madison Avenue North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$63,000.00	07-00-009-112-001
4/18/2018	17CV193257	6273 West River Road South Elyria, Oh 44035	\$36,000.00	06-24-009-105-004
4/18/2018	17CV193606	125 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$27,000.00	02-01-003-180-001
4/18/2018	17TX006838	Vacant Lot Located Directly Between 167 Bath Street And 171 Bath Street E		06-24-055-102-005
4/18/2018	17TX006868	701 West 17Th Street, Lorain, Oh 440525 Vacant Lots		02-01-003-135-026 02-01-003-143-001 02-01-003-143-002 02-01-003-143-003 02-01-006-136-002 02-01-006-136-001
4/18/2018	17TX006898	475 10Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035		06-26-017-000-029
4/18/2018	17TX006938	307 Colorado Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052		02-01-002-108-003, 02-01-002-108-004, 02-01-002-108-005
4/18/2018	17TX006942	Two Vacant Lots Lorain, Oh 44052		03-00-102-111-016, 03-00-102-111-034
5/2/2018	12CV176475	645 Sycamore Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$117,000.00	06-25-019-102-012
5/2/2018	13CV180933	169 Brook Valley Drive Elyria, Oh 44035	\$117,000.00	06-23-025-107-015
5/2/2018	16CV190881	5892 Olive Avenue North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$99,000.00	07-00-017-121-020, 07-00-017-121-021
5/2/2018	17CV191610	9800 Root Road Columbia Station, Oh 44028	\$69,000.00	11-00-010-000-026
5/2/2018	17CV191684	13254 Hale Road Oberlin, Oh 44074	\$60,000.00	09-00-090-000-107
5/2/2018	17CV192049	648 Hilliard Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$66,000.00	06-25-032-114-015
5/2/2018	17CV192423	3358 Livingston Avenue Lorain, Oh 44055	\$33,000.00	02-01-003-227-019
5/2/2018	17CV192425	1906 Grafton Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$120,000.00	10-00-004-131-061, 10-00-005-105-002
5/2/2018	17CV192968	5879 Lee Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$81,000.00	07-00-020-116-077
5/2/2018	17CV193173	2909 Andrews Place Lorain, Oh 44052	\$60,000.00	02-02-016-115-020
5/2/2018	17CV193308	37740 North Doovys Street Avon, Oh 44011	\$162,000.00	04-00-010-102-014
5/2/2018	17CV193355	214 9Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$39,000.00	06-26-019-101-014
5/2/2018	17CV193481	835 West 19Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052	\$42,000.00	02-01-006-142-019
5/2/2018	17CV193612	5528 Olive Avenue North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$90,000.00	07-00-018-103-072

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office	Appraisal Amount	Sale Price
5/2/2018	17CV193644	7119 Avon Belden Road North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$75,000.00	07-00-021-117-005
5/2/2018	17TX006846	312 West 29Th Street Lorain, Oh 44055		02-01-003-198-020
5/2/2018	17TX006848	1119 West 23Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44052		02-01-006-156-015, 02-01-006-156-024, 02-01-006-156-025
5/2/2018	17TX006897	Vacant Lot Located On The Westerly Side Of Elm Str 287.98 Feet Northerly		03-00-035-113-016
5/2/2018	17TX006899	554 C Street Lorain, Oh 44052		02-01-002-108-017
5/2/2018	17TX006919	319 West 18Th Street Lorain, Oh 44052		02-01-003-154-001 02-01-003-154-002
5/16/2018	09CV163926	409 South Main Street Wellington, Oh 44090		18-00-022-108-048
5/16/2018	09TX005869	A Vacant Lot Located On The Northerly Side Of Cooper Foster Park Road E	Cancelled	05-00-099-000-093
5/16/2018	12CV175866	2329 East 32Nd Street Lorain, Oh 44055		03-00-082-104-019
5/16/2018	14CV185247	252 West College Street Oberlin, Oh 44074	\$90,000.00	09-00-085-101-029
5/16/2018	15CV187169	12457 Eaton Boulevard Grafton, Oh 44044	\$39,000.00	11-00-036-113-019
5/16/2018	16CV190597	32689 Redwood Boulevard Avon Lake, Oh 44012	\$210,000.00	04-00-018-182-001
5/16/2018	16CV190982	108 Annis Road South Amherst, Oh 44001	\$54,000.00	05-00-030-000-005 05-00-011-105-026
5/16/2018	16CV191196	169 Warren Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035	\$57,000.00	06-25-015-106-045
5/16/2018	17CV191545	3500 Oberlin Avenue Lorain, Oh 44053	\$99,000.00	02-02-015-109-069 02-02-015-109-070
5/16/2018	17CV191868	961 Valley Boulevard Elyria, Oh 44035	\$75,000.00	06-25-032-104-012
5/16/2018	17CV192337	6191 Greenview Trail North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$183,000.00	07-00-032-000-467
5/16/2018	17CV192556	4900 Rosewood Drive Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$99,000.00	03-00-036-109-007
5/16/2018	17CV192888	943 North West River Road Elyria, Oh 44035	\$30,000.00	06-24-167-000-011
5/16/2018	17CV193044	429 10Th Street Elyria, Oh 44035	\$39,000.00	06-26-017-000-042
5/16/2018	17CV193272	9388 Victoria Lane North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$210,000.00	07-00-036-000-117
5/16/2018	17CV193531	6017 Emerald Street North Ridgeville, Oh 44039	\$132,000.00	07-00-017-129-045
5/16/2018	17CV193636	1404 New Jersey Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052	\$60,000.00	03-00-056-111-008
5/16/2018	17CV193645	180 South Pleasant Street Oberlin, Oh 44074	\$63,000.00	09-00-096-101-017
5/16/2018	17CV193961	244 Grafton Street Oberlin, Oh 44074	\$66,000.00	09-00-096-109-020 09-00-096-109-021
5/16/2018	17CV193994	235 Indiana Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052	\$33,000.00	02-00-051-104-014
5/16/2018	17TX006884	Commonly Known As: Two Adjacent Lots On The Westerly Side Of West St		03-00-038-118-040, 03-00-038-118-041
5/16/2018	17TX006930	Vacant Lot Located Directly Between 128 West 23Rd Street And 122 West :		02-01-003-173-023
5/16/2018	17TX006959	Vacant Parcel Of Land Located Directly Between 1815 East 29Th Street An		03-00-096-115-012
5/16/2018	17TX006969	706 East Erie Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052		Cancelled

Sale Date	Case Number	Lorain County Sheriff's Office	Appraisal Amount	Sale Price
5/30/2018	16CV188796	10131 Dupont Drive Columbia Station, Oh 44622		12-00-020-112-005
5/30/2018	17CV191360	724 Irving Park Boulevard Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054	\$81,000.00	03-00-036-125-004
5/30/2018	17CV192285	121 Kenwood Street Elyria, Oh 44035		06-25-013-101-005
5/30/2018	17CV192411	32927 Meadow Creek Oval North Ridgeville, Oh 44039		07-00-006-101-088
5/30/2018	17CV192711	1775 East 33Rd Street Lorain, Oh 44055		03-00-096-112-043
5/30/2018	17CV192772	436 Maple Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054		03-00-035-110-068
5/30/2018	17CV193149	49909 State Route 511 Amherst, Oh 44001		08-12-017-000-007
5/30/2018	17CV193240	208 South Leavitt Road Amherst, Oh 44001		05-00-037-110-028
5/30/2018	17CV193374	220 Boston Avenue Elyria, Oh 44035		06-25-013-110-064 06-25-013-110-065
5/30/2018	17CV193701	1620 Maine Avenue Lorain, Oh 44052		03-00-053-104-018
5/30/2018	17TX006858	Vacant Lot Directly North Of 569 Irondale Street Elyria, Oh 44035		06-24-010-104-038
5/30/2018	17TX006882	549 Oakwood Avenue Sheffield Lake, Oh 44054 And A 27' By 100' Vacant L		03-00-038-108-037 03-00-038-108-008 03-00-038-108-042